
AGENDA 
The First Business Meeting of the Month of March 

of the Board of Education of Township High School District 214 
 will be held on Thursday, March 17, 2022 

in the Theatre of the Forest View Educational Center 
2121 S. Goebbert Road, Arlington Heights, IL 

at 7:00 p.m. 
 

I. CALL TO ORDER 
         President Dussling 
 

II. ROLL CALL 
         Ms. Keyes 
 

III. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
 

IV. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
Business Meeting of February 10, 2022 
Closed Session Meeting of February 10, 2022 
Workshop Meeting of March 3, 2022 
Closed Session Meeting of March 3, 2022 
 

 

V. RECOGNITION 
District Service Awards 
Student Excellence 
 

 

VI. SUPERINTENDENT’S REPORT 
Freedom of Information Act Report 
Nutrition Report 
Block Schedule Survey Data 
 

 

VII. PUBLIC HEARING FOR HONORABLE DISMISSALS (approximately 7:30 pm) 
  

VIII. PUBLIC COMMENTS 
 

IX. BOARD MEMBER UPDATES 
 

X. CONSENT CALENDAR 
2022-026 Accounts Payable 
2022-027 Personnel Transaction Report 
2022-028 Destruction of Closed Minutes Audio Recordings 
2022-029 IHSA Lacrosse Athletic Program Renewal 
2022-030 Board Policy Revisions 
2022-031 Encumbrance and Expenditure Authorization 
2022-032 Student Accident Insurance 
2022-033 Asbestos Abatement Bid 
2022-034 Graduation Audio Services Bid 
2022-035 FVEC Training Facility Foundation and Shell Bid  

 
 

XI. ACTION ITEM (The public may comment on each item after Board discussion.) 
2022-036 Academic Programs and Pathways Guidebook Revisions 



2022-037 Preliminary Budget Guidelines and Assumptions 
 

 

XII. CLOSED SESSION 
o The appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or dismissal 

of specific employees, specific individuals who serve as independent contractors in 
an educational setting, or specific volunteers of the public body or legal counsel for 
the public body, including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an 
employee, a specific individual who serves as an independent contractor in an 
educational setting, or a volunteer of the public body or against legal counsel for the 
public body to determine its validity. 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1), amended by P.A. 101-459 

 
XIII. RECONVENE IN OPEN MEETING 

Immediately following the Closed Session, the Board of Education will reconvene in Open 
Session and may take action deemed necessary as a result of the Closed Session 
discussions. 

o The appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or dismissal 
of specific employees, specific individuals who serve as independent contractors in 
an educational setting, or specific volunteers of the public body or legal counsel for 
the public body, including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an 
employee, a specific individual who serves as an independent contractor in an 
educational setting, or a volunteer of the public body or against legal counsel for the 
public body to determine its validity. 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1), amended by P.A. 101-459 
  

XIV. ADJOURNMENT 
 
 



MINUTES 
 

The Minutes of the First Business Meeting  
of the Month of February of the Board of Education 

Township High School District 214 held on February 10, 2022 
at the Forest View Educational Center, 

2121 S. Goebbert Road, Arlington Heights, Illinois 
at 7:00 p.m. 

 
President Dussling called the meeting to order at 7:02 p.m. and L. Keyes called the roll.  The following 
members were present: 
  William Dussling  President 

Mark Hineman   Member    
  Alva Kreutzer   Member 
  Andrea Rauch   Member 
  Dan Petro   Member  
Absent at roll call:   

Mildred Palmer   Vice President 
Leonard Walker   Member 
 

Also present at the meeting were:  D. Schuler, superintendent; C. Johnson, associate superintendent for 
finance and operations; K. Kraft, associate superintendent for human resources; L. Lopez, associate 
superintendent for teaching and learning; M. Johnson, assistant superintendent for student services; J. 
Wardle, principal, BGHS; G. Minter, principal, PHS; P. Mogge, director of community engagement and 
outreach; T. Schlorff, director of instructional technology and technology services; L. Keyes, executive 
assistant to the school board and superintendent; staff members; parents; students; and citizens. 
 
1. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
President Dussling led the Board and audience in the Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
2. APPROVAL OF MINUTES 
It was moved by D. Petro and seconded by M. Hineman that the Board of Education approve the minutes 
of the Special Meeting and Closed Session of January 14, 2022 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Abstain: Kreutzer 
Nays: None 
 
It was moved by A. Kreutzer and seconded by D. Petro to approve the Regular Meeting and the Closed 
Session of January 20, 2022 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
3. BOARD RECOGNITION 
The following were recognized for their achievements in the areas indicated: 

Infinite Visions Implementation Team 
Human Resources: Jenny Herrera, Shawn Collins, Amy North 
Technology: Tracy Harper  
Business Department: Jim Palmer, Nicole Hansen 
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Multimedia Communications Pathway 
Pat Mogge introduced a video presentation featuring the work of the students from the  
Multimedia Communications Pathway 

 
4. PUBLIC COMMENTS 

● J. Arey, Education Association President, addressed the Board about teachers continuing to teach 
and support students during the time of COVID 

● M. Tantillo, teacher, addressed the Board about teacher challenges during COVID  
● A. Giatoni, teacher, addressed the Board about teacher challenges during COVID 
● K. Hann, parent, addressed the Board with concerns about the Earned Honors Program 
● G. Songer, educator, addressed the Board about recent COVID litigation  
● R. Stalberg, resident, addressed the Board about COVID vaccinations and mask requirements 
● E. Wojiak, parent, addressed the Board about COVID measures 
● A. Osterman, parent, addressed the Board about masks and bullying  
● D. McCall, parent, addressed the Board about masks and bullying 
● M. Edwardsen, parent, addressed the Board with a suggestion to require parent signatures for 

student course selections 
● E. Bauer, parent, addressed the Board about personal finance class offerings 
● M. Consensus Vickers, resident, addressed the Board with concerns about the Earned Honors 

Program; masks optional; and concerns for teachers 
● C. Murcia, parent, addressed the Board about divisiveness due to masks and CRT 

 
5. SUPERINTENDENT REPORT 
D. Schuler reported that the district responded to the following Freedom of Information Act requests 
consistent with Illinois School Code: 

1. A. Batalia requested operational information 
2. Citizens Advisory Group requested personnel information 
3. J. Derengowski requested communications regarding student IDs  
4. R. Dodson/Frank@chalkboardheresy requested all instructional and professional 

development information 
5. J. Fagg/ABC7 requested remote learning equipment information 
6. N. Foley requested surety bond copies 
7. M. Kaniewska requested financial information and communications 
8. G. Mendez/(Indiana, IL, Iowa Fdn for Fair Contracting) requested bid information 
9. N. Mihelich/IRTA requested personnel information 

 
D. Schuler reported that the quarterly suspension data report was included with the Board’s materials. 
 
D. Schuler reported on the recent COVID litigation.  
 
At the July 29, 2021 special meeting, the administration and the Board strongly recommended but did not 
require masks. On August 4, 2021, a Governor’s Executive Order required masks in school settings.  
Last fall, a lawsuit was filed against the state and governor questioning the authority to require masks.  
 
Last Friday, February 4, 2022, a temporary restraining order was issued by the circuit court, allowing 
certain named students to attend school without masks. In addition, health departments are in charge of 
tracing, not schools. No testing, no vaccines, no quarantines can be required by a school district named in 
the lawsuit. In school districts in which a Board of Education passed a rule or policy for mandatory 
masks, the local school district could still require them of other students. D214 did not pass a rule for 
mandatory masks. District 214 will return to our July 29, 2021 recommendation: masks are strongly 
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recommended but not required. Students being transported must wear masks because of the federal CDC 
requirement. 
 
Additionally, the Illinois High School Association (for athletics) ruled the host site determines mitigation 
requirements. All schools in our conference are taking the same stance, recommended, not required.  
 
We are waiting for the appellate court to rule for or against the TRO.  We have complied consistently 
with the law and will continue to do so. Our risk management company was consulted and they agree we 
are covered as long as we follow the law.  
 
D. Schuler then reviewed the COVID data slides. The Cook County Department of Health would 
determine closures or mitigation in the case of another surge in cases.  
 
D. Schuler issued a heartfelt thank you to all staff and students. 
 
Board Discussion 
D. Petro and A. Rauch asked questions about mitigation measures, positive COVID student protocol and 
monitoring COVID data. 
 
6. BOARD MEMBER UPDATES 
A. Rauch reported the Wheeling NJROTC hosted the Chicagoland Drill Competition, the 20th year of 
competition, with 12 teams participating. 
 
M. Hineman reported that the Special Olympics team has been expanded and rebranded districtwide 
—complete with a new logo. The District 214 Special Olympics team participates in regional and state 
competitions in volleyball, snowshoeing, basketball, floor hockey, soccer and track and field.  
 
M. Hineman reported that he attended a Learning Walk at Buffalo Grove, visiting the machine shop 
where students used geometry and hands on learning and a law and diversity class. 
 
A. Kreutzer thanked the principals who hosted her tours of the schools.  
 
A. Kreutzer reported that Elk Grove High School girls’ gymnastics coach Abi Diaz has been named Mid-
Suburban League Coach of the year for the fifth time.  
 
A. Keutzer reported Elk Grove High School students gave back to their community by winning the recent 
Cereal Bowl V competition. During the December competition, students from Elk Grove and Rolling 
Meadows high schools raised a record number of 2,592 boxes of cereal – all donated to the food pantry. 
 
B. Dussling reported the National Technical Honor Society held their induction last week, with 15-20 
students inducted from each school. 
 
B. Dussling reported he attended the Rolling Meadows Chamber Orchestra performance at the Illinois 
Music Educators’ Association’s Conference in Peoria, one of only two groups in the state chosen to 
perform. 
 
B. Dussling reported the Prospect Dance Team was one of six teams to advance from sectionals to the 
IHSA State Finals.  
 
 



Board of Education 
February 10, 2022 

Page 4 of 7 
 

7. APPROVE CONSENT CALENDAR         2022-012 through 2022-015 
It was moved by Kreutzer and seconded by Hineman that the Board of Education approve Items 2022-012 
through 2022-015, appearing on the Consent Calendar as presented. 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 

A. Approve Accounts Payable                2022-012 

1/12/2022 AP Run 

Fund Fund Description  

10 Education        251,448.10 

20 Operations and Maintenance        279,402.03 

30 Debt Service            1,150.00 

40 Transportation            1,294.40 

60 Capital Projects            1,992.96 

 Total        535,287.49 

 Check numbers: 751010-751160  

   

1/20/2022 AP Run 

Fund Fund Description  

10 Education        684,544.93 

20 Operations and Maintenance          88,560.41 

40 Transportation        359,425.47 

60 Capital Projects          22,482.16 

 Total    1,155,012.97 

 Check numbers:751161-751333  

   

2/3/2022 AP Run 

Fund Fund Description  

10 Education    1,757,453.87 

20 Operations and Maintenance        236,483.35 

40 Transportation        690,837.03 

60 Capital Projects        481,819.69 

 Total    3,166,593.94 

 Check numbers: 751343-751636  
       

B. Personnel Transaction Report                          2022-013 
Approved Personnel Transaction Report attached to these minutes. 
 
C. Destruction of Closed Meeting Audio Recordings                                     2022-014  
Approved the destruction of closed session audio recording for the July, 9 2020 meeting  
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D.  Closed Session Minutes, Six Month Review                       2022-015 
Approved that the need for confidentiality still exists for closed session minutes and they will not 
be released at this time. 

 
8. RESOLUTION APPROVING TRS SSP EMPLOYER PARTICIPATION                     2022-016 

AGREEMENT            
It was moved by Kreutzer and seconded by Rauch that the Board of Education approve the Resolution 
Approving TRS SSP Employer Participation Agreement. 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
9. ACADEMIC PROGRAMS AND PATHWAYS GUIDEBOOK 2022-2023          2022-017 
Laz Lopez presented the final edits and clean-up for the academic programs and pathways guidebook 
2022-2023. 
 
10. PRELIMINARY 2022-23 BUDGET GUIDELINES AND ASSUMPTIONS                  2022-018 
Cathy Johnson reviewed the process for creating the budget for 2022-23, including the guiding 
parameters, preliminary budget guidelines, and budget assumptions.                   
 
Board Discussion: 
D. Petro and A. Kreutzer asked questions about inflation numbers, increases in prices for gas and food 
services, and the impact to the Capital Projects Plan.  
 
Public Comments: 
M. Edwardsen, parent, commented on salaries and the Teacher Retirement System   
 
11.  CLOSED SESSION 
It was moved by Kreutzer and seconded by Petro that the Board of Education convene in Closed Session 
(with action to follow) for the purpose of discussing: 

o The appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or dismissal of specific 
employees specific individuals who serve as independent contractors in a park, recreational, or 
educational setting, or specific volunteers of the public body or legal counsel for the public body, 
including hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an employee, a specific individual 
who serves as an independent contractor in a park, recreational, or educational setting, or a 
volunteer of the public body or against legal counsel for the public body to determine its validity. 
However, a meeting to consider an increase in compensation to a specific employee of a public 
body that is subject to the Local Government Wage Increase Transparency Act may not be closed 
and shall be open to the public and posted and held in accordance with [the Open Meetings Act]. 
5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1), amended by P.A. 101-459;   

o The purchase or lease of real property for the use of the District, including meetings held for the 
purpose of discussing whether a particular parcel should be acquired.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(5); 

o The placement of individual students in special education programs and other matters relating to 
individual students.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(10); 

o Litigation, when an action against, affecting or on behalf of the particular district has been filed 
and is pending before a court or administrative tribunal, or when the district finds that an action is 
probable or imminent, in which case the basis for the finding shall be recorded and entered into 
the closed meeting minutes.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(12); 
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o Collective negotiating matters between the district and its employees or their representatives, or 
deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of employees.  5ILCS 
120/2(c)(2);  

Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
  
The Board convened in Closed Session at 8:35 p.m. 
 
12. RECONVENE IN OPEN SESSION  
It was moved by Kretuzer and seconded by Rauch that the Board of Education reconvene in Open Session 
after discussing: 

o The appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or dismissal of 
specific employees specific individuals who serve as independent contractors in an educational 
setting, or specific volunteers of the public body or legal counsel for the public body, including 
hearing testimony on a complaint lodged against an employee, a specific individual who serves as 
an independent contractor in an educational setting, or a volunteer of the public body or against 
legal counsel for the public body to determine its validity. However, a meeting to consider an 
increase in compensation to a specific employee of a public body that is subject to the Local 
Government Wage Increase Transparency Act may not be closed and shall be open to the public 
and posted and held in accordance with [the Open Meetings Act]. 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1), amended 
by P.A. 101-459;   
o The purchase or lease of real property for the use of the District, including meetings held 
for the purpose of discussing whether a particular parcel should be acquired.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(5); 
o The placement of individual students in special education programs and other matters 
relating to individual students.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(10); 
o Litigation, when an action against, affecting or on behalf of the particular district has 
been filed and is pending before a court or administrative tribunal, or when the district finds that 
an action is probable or imminent, in which case the basis for the finding shall be recorded and 
entered into the closed meeting minutes.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(12); 
o Collective negotiating matters between the district and its employees or their 
representatives, or deliberations concerning salary schedules for one or more classes of 
employees.  5ILCS 120/2(c)(2); 

 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
The Board reconvened in Open Session at 9:33 p.m. 
 
13. STUDENT OUTPLACEMENT                2022-019 
It was moved by Rauch and seconded by Petro that the Board of Education approve outplacement of 
student #2824022452 at North Cook Young Adult Academy 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
14.  STUDENT OUTPLACEMENT                2022-020 
It was moved by Hineman and seconded by Kretuzer that the Board of Education approve outplacement 
of student # 2424020922 at North Cook Young Adult Academy 
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Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
15. PERSONNEL TRANSACTION REPORT II              2022-021 
It was moved by Petro and seconded by Kretuzer that the Board of Education approve PTR II including 
the following appointments: 
 Quiana McNeal, Associate Principal, Elk Grove 
 Rebekah Gavril, Health Services Supervisor I, Wheeling 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
16. PURCHASE OF REAL PROPERTY FOR THE PRACTICAL             2022-022 

ARCHITECTURAL CONSTRUCTION PATHWAY PROGRAM     
It was moved by Kretuzer and seconded by Petro that the Board of Education approve the purchase of real 
property, 2804 Fremont Street, Rolling Meadows for the PAC program. 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 
17. ADJOURNMENT 
It was moved by Petro and seconded by Kreutzer to adjourn.  The motion carried. 
 
The meeting adjourned at 9:35 p.m. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
_______________________________   ________________________________ 
William J. Dussling, President    Mildred Palmer, Vice President 
 



MINUTES 
 

The Minutes of the Workshop Meeting  
of the Month of March of the Board of Education 

Township High School District 214 held on March 3, 2022 
at John Hersey High School, 
Arlington Heights, Illinois 

at 6:30 p.m. 
 

President Dussling called the meeting to order at 6:32 p.m. and L. Keyes called the roll.  The following 
members were present: 
  William Dussling  President 
  Mildred Palmer   Vice President 

Mark Hineman   Member    
  Alva Kreutzer   Member 
  Andrea Rauch   Member 
  Dan Petro   President 
  Leonard Walker   Member 
   
Also present at the meeting were:  D. Schuler, superintendent; C. Johnson, associate superintendent for 
finance and operations; K. Kraft, associate superintendent for human resources; L. Lopez, associate 
superintendent for teaching and learning; P. Kelly, principal, EGHS; K. Rogers, principal, JHHS; E. Hart, 
principal, RMHS; P. Mogge, director of community engagement and outreach; L. Keyes, executive 
assistant to the school board and superintendent; staff members; and citizens. 
 
1. PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE 
President Dussling led the Board and audience in the Pledge of Allegiance. 
 
2. PUBLIC COMMENTS 
None 
 
3. APPROVE CONSENT CALENDAR         2022-023 through 2022-024 
It was moved by Kreutzer and seconded by Rauch that the Board of Education approve Items 2022-023 
through 2022-024, appearing on the Consent Calendar as presented. 
 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Hineman, Kreutzer, Palmer, Walker, Rauch, Petro, Dussling 
Nays: None 
 

A. Approve Accounts Payable                                        2022-023 
Actual February 17, 2022 listing: 

Educational Fund Listing $3,694,756.03 
Operations and Maintenance       404,091.11 
Transportation Fund       327,935.00 
Capital Projects 62       107,106.97 
TOTAL   $4,533,889.11 

Checks Dated:  February 17, 2022 
Check Numbers:  751644 - 751984 

           
B. Personnel Transaction Report                          2022-024 

Approved Personnel Transaction Report attached to these minutes. 
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4. SUPERINTENDENT REPORT 
Superintendent Schuler introduced Hersey principal K. Rogers and associate principal P. Grow who 
updated the Board on Hersey’s Social-Emotional Focus and Learning Renewal Plan for 2021-2022. K. 
Rogers reported an increase in interventions and applauded his support services team for their great work, 
even with an increased case load. P. Grow shared that more than 50% students have recovered credit, 
aided by 75 student tutors.  
 
Superintendent Schuler introduced P. Kelly and E. Hart who presented an update on the Earned Honors 
Pilot currently in its second year at Elk Grove and first year at Rolling Meadows. A video featuring 
teachers in the pilot, commenting on the strengths of the program for both teachers and students, was 
viewed. The students who participated will be monitored their junior and senior years to see if the growth 
continues to maintain or escalate. More students at EGHS have signed up for junior AP English than ever 
before. Next steps include calibrate, measure other outcomes, track where they go next and expand PLCs. 
The Board discussed how to showcase the program to the public with greater detail and data, to make it 
easier to understand the greater benefits. 
 
5.  CLOSED SESSION 
It was moved by Kreutzer and seconded by Palmer that the Board of Education convene in Closed 
Session for the purpose of discussing: 

● The appointment, employment, compensation, discipline, performance, or dismissal of specific 
employees, specific individuals who serve as independent contractors in an educational setting, 
or specific volunteers of the public body or legal counsel for the public body, including hearing 
testimony on a complaint lodged against an employee, a specific individual who serves as an 
independent contractor in an educational setting, or a volunteer of the public body or against 
legal counsel for the public body to determine its validity. 5 ILCS 120/2(c)(1) 

 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Dussling, Hineman, Kreutzer, Palmer, Walker, Rauch, Petro 
Nays: None 
  
The Board convened in Closed Session at 8:35 p.m. 
 
6. RECONVENE IN OPEN SESSION  
 
It was moved by Petro and seconded by Kretuzer that the Board of Education reconvene in Open Session. 
 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Dussling, Hineman, Kreutzer, Palmer, Walker, Rauch, Petro 
Nays: None 
 
The Board reconvened in Open Session at 9:13 p.m. 
 
7. PERSONNEL TRANSACTION REPORT II 
It was moved by Petro and seconded by Kretuzer that the Board of Education approve Personnel 
Transaction Report II including the following appointments: 
• Rebecca Schilz, Division Head Student Success, Safety, and Wellness, EG 
• Cecile Flores-Herbas, Division Head Social Science, World Languages, WHS 
the following change in status: 
• Henry Brown, Resignation 
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and the following Voluntary Retirement Program, 2026: 
• Patricia Collins, HR Supervisor 
 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Dussling, Hineman, Kreutzer, Palmer, Walker, Rauch, Petro 
Nays: None 
 
8. PERSONNEL TRANSACTION REPORT III 
It was moved by Walker and seconded by Palmer that the Board of Education approve Personnel 
Transaction Report III, including a resolution for a 30-day suspension without pay for employee Thomas 
Whalen. 
 
Upon roll call, the motion carried. 
Ayes:  Dussling, Hineman, Kreutzer, Palmer, Walker, Rauch, Petro 
Nays: None 
 
9. ADJOURNMENT 
It was moved by Walker and seconded by Palmer to adjourn.  The motion carried. 
 
The meeting adjourned at 9:15 p.m. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
_______________________________   ________________________________ 
William J. Dussling, President    Mildred Palmer, Vice President 
 



ITEM NO: 2022-027
DATE: March 17, 2022
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PERSONNEL TRANSACTION REPORT

EMPLOYMENT OF EDUCATION ASSOCIATION PERSONNEL 2021-2022
CHANGE IN STATUS
Name
MCARDLE, SAMANTHA World Languages - JHHS
Remarks Resignation

Effective: May 27, 2022

SALZMANN, KIMBERLY Math - EGHS
Remarks Resignation

Effective: May 27, 2022

CURCIO, JAMIE World Languages - RMHS
Remarks Resignation

Effective: May 27, 2022

Voluntary Retirement Program - Education Association - 2026
Name Assignment
KOELPER, JANET Math - WHS
Remarks Intent to Participate 

Effective Last day of school, 2026
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EMPLOYMENT OF CUSTODIAL MAINTENANCE PERSONNEL 2021 - 2022

CHANGE

Name: Assignment Salary Hrs./Week

MCKENNA, GREGORY
Remarks: Maintenance II (FVEC)

Resignation

Effective: May 15, 2022

EMPLOYMENT OF EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT PERSONNEL 2021 - 2022

CHANGE

Name: Assignment Salary Hrs./Week

AKOVALI, ZEYNEP

Remarks: Tutoring Assistant - ARA (BGHS)

Resignation

Effective: March 18, 2022

ALTAN, BATIKAN

Remarks: Campus Security (BGHS)

Grade 3, Step 1 $21.80 40

From: Campus Security (EGHS)

Effective: March 28, 2022

GUTIERREZ, MARCELA

Remarks: Attendance Assistant (WHS)

Resignation

Effective: March 25, 2022

LUSSOW, FREDERICK, JR.

Remarks: Campus Security (EGHS)

Resignation

Effective: March 11, 2022

POULOS, VICKI

Remarks: Bookkeeper (PHS)

Resignation

CLASSIFIED PERSONNEL TRANSACTION REPORT
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From: June 30, 2024

Effective: June 30, 2023

SPANEVELLO, MATTHEW (FLAVIO)

Remarks: Instructional Assistant - ELL (WHS)

Leave of Absence (Student Teaching)

Effective: August 22, 2022 - December 5, 2022

EMPLOYMENT OF EDUCATIONAL SUPPORT PERSONNEL 2021 - 2022

NEW

Name: Assignment Salary Hrs./Week

GOMEZ, DORA

Remarks: Attendance Assistant/Division Assistant (EGHS)

Grade 3, Step 1 $21.80 33.75

Effective: March 18, 2022

KURINEC, CASEY

Remarks: Campus Security (WHS)

Grade 3, Step 1 $21.80 40

Effective: March 18, 2022



                   ITEM: 2022-028 
                   DATE: Mar. 17, 2022   

                                                                                                                FILE:  Meetings             
 
 
SUBJECT:   Destruction of Closed Meeting Audio Recordings 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
 
The Illinois Open Meetings Act (5 ILCS 120/2.06) requires that Boards of Education keep a 
verbatim record of their closed meetings in the form of an audio or video recording.  After 18 
months have passed since being made, the audio or video recording of a closed meeting may be 
destroyed, provided the Board approved:  1) its destruction; and, 2) minutes of the particular 
closed meeting. 
 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION: 
 
The Board of Education approved the following minutes of the closed meetings as indicated: 
 Date of Meeting Date of Approval   
 August 13, 2020 September 10, 2020 
   
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 
That the Board of Education approve the destruction of closed session audio recordings older 
than 18 months. 
  



ITEM NO: 2022-029
DATE: March 14, 2022
FILE: IHSA

Subject:  Application for Cooperative Team Sponsorship Elk Grove High School and
Wheeling High School Lacrosse

BACKGROUND INFORMATION

We have continued to promote and monitor program lacrosse numbers as we begin our second
season across the district. While most schools have experienced strong numbers and growth, Elk
Grove and Wheeling high schools continue to have lower student interest. In order to continue to
maximize our co-curricular offerings, the district is seeking a cooperative between the boys and
girls programs at Elk Grove and Wheeling high schools.

ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION

The IHSA allows for a cooperative team to be formed according to Section 2.030 of the By-laws
in the IHSA Handbook. The cooperative agreement, if approved, will allow for Elk Grove and
Wheeling to compete within the IHSA and MSL as a cooperative over the next two seasons
(Spring 2022/2023). The agreement will expire on June 30, 2023, allowing Elk Grove and
Wheeling time to continue to build interest and program numbers for boys and girls lacrosse.

RECOMMENDED ACTION

That the Board of Education approves the Application for Cooperative Team Sponsorship to
allow the Elk Grove and Wheeling boys and girls lacrosse teams to participate in gameplay for
the 2021-2122 school year and potentially the 2022-2023 school year, if needed.



  
 
 
SUBJECT:   Board of Education Policy Manual Revisions – PRESS Edition 
 
  
BACKGROUND  
  
One of the goals of the Board of Education and administration for the 2007-08 school year was to conduct 
a comprehensive review the District 214 Board of Education Policy Manual.  After researching possible 
methods to accomplish a thorough review, the Board agreed to work with the Illinois Association of 
School Boards (IASB) for a complete review and revision of Board policies. A working group met over 
the course of five months to review and revise each policy for District 214.  The IASB consultant met 
with the Board of Education on June 30, 2008 to present the revised Policy Manual at a Board Workshop. 
The Board of Education approved the new manual on August 7, 2008.    
  
In addition to the comprehensive review, the District 214 Board of Education is using the Policy 
Reference Education Subscription Service (PRESS) of IASB to keep the policy manual up to date.  This 
resource provides the legal rationale and references for suggested policy revisions to assist the Board in 
focusing on their leadership role while complying with state and federal law.   
  
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION  
  
The IASB Policy Reference Manual provides a system for regular updating of policies to ensure legal 
compliance and provides cross-referencing of related policies and the legal references. Every policy is 
reviewed at least once every five years or as a result of state or federal, Illinois School Code, or Illinois 
School Board of Education regulation or rule changes.  The administration also makes recommendations 
for policy revisions as needed.  Additionally, the Board is required by School Code to review select 
policies either annually or biennially.  
  
RECOMMENDATION  
 
That the Board of Education approve the recommended policy revisions from PRESS and administration 
as presented:  

  
 
 

ITEM: 2022-030 
DATE: 03/17/2022
FILE: Policy 

2:106 2:120 E 2:172 2.250 3.10 
4.16 4.45 4.82 4.165 4.172 
5.125 5.180 5.190 5.250 5.260 
5.262 6.140 6.270 7.142 7.285 
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ITEM:  2022-031 
DATE:      March 17, 2022 
FILE:  Budget 

 
 
Subject:  2022-23 Encumbrance and Expenditure Authorization 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
 
The budget year for a school district is July 1 through June 30. The School Code requires Boards of 
Education to adopt a budget for a fiscal year by the end of the first quarter or September 30. The district's 
2022-23 budget calendar calls for Board review and approval of the tentative budget on July 2022. 
Approval of the official budget is scheduled for September  2022. 
 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATIONS: 
 
To accommodate the need for timely ordering and payment of services, supplies, and equipment, and 
the payment of salaries and benefits prior to official budget approval, on an annual basis the 
administration recommends Board authorization for the administration: 

 
•  to encumber and expend up to 75 percent of the 2022-23 preliminary control budgets, 

which are being developed within budget guidelines established by the Board of Education; 
and  

 
• to pay salaries and benefits within Board approved rates and schedules. 

 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 
That the Board of Education authorizes the administration to encumber and expend up to 75 percent of 
the 2022-23 preliminary budgets, which are being developed within budget guidelines established by 
the Board of Education, and to pay salaries and benefits within Board approved rates and schedules 
prior to official budget approval. 
 
 



 

 

 
 

ITEM: 2022-032 
DATE: March 17, 2022 
FILE:   Student Insurance 

 
 
 
Subject:  Student Accident Insurance 2022-23 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
 
Historically, a student accident insurance program has been offered to District 214 parents. The 
administration reviewed the student accident insurance program and recommends that the Board of 
Education continue a student accident insurance program offering for the next school year. This 
recommended program has two coverage levels: standard and deluxe. There is no cost to the district as 
past Board action requires parents make payments directly to the insurance company. For 2022-23, the 
insurer will be 1st Agency. The administration recommends offering this plan for the 2022-23 school 
year. 
 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATIONS: 
 
The attached schedule summarizes the benefits and rates for the 2022-23 student accident insurance 
program. 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 
That the Board of Education approves the 2022-23 student accident insurance program. 



1st Agency Student Accident Insurance Rates

COVERAGE AND BENEFITS 2022-23 Standard Plan 2022-23 Deluxe Plan

Maximum Benefit Amount Per Injury $25,000) $25,000)

Deductible $0 $0

Hospital Room & Board and general nursing care, limited to a maximum of $200 per day $600 per day

Intensive Care, limited to a maximum of $200 per day $600 per day

Miscellaneous Hospital Charges, limited to a maximum of $1,500 $3,000

Doctor's Charges for Surgery, in accordance with the Surgical Schedule using $75 per unit value $200 per unit value

Administration of Anesthesia, limited to
20% of the Surgical Schedule 

allowance
20% of the Surgical Schedule 

allowanceAssistant Surgeon Charge, limited to

Non-Surgical Doctors' Visits, including Physical Therapy: 1st Visit up to
                                                                                                   Thereafter up to
Physical Therapy is limited to a maximum benefit of 5 visits

$25
$15

$60
$50

Hospital Emergency Care, excluding professional charges, limited to a maximum 
of $200 $400

Outpatient Imaging Procedures and Interpretation of MRI/CAT Scan. Up to a 
maximum benefit of $200 $500

Outpatient X-ray Services, limited to a maximum of $200 $500

Ambulance Charges, limited to a maximum of $100 $400

Durable Medical Equipment including orthopedic appliances, limited to a 
maximum of $100 $200

Dental Treatment, per tooth (for Injury to Sound, Natural Teeth), limited to $200 $600

Motor Vehicle Accident injuries, limited to $5,000 $5,000

Loss of Life $5,000 $5,000

Single Dismemberment - (Loss of one hand, one foot, entire sight of one eye or 
hearing one ear) $1,000 $1,000

Double Dismemberment - (Loss of both hands, both fee, entire sight of both 
eyes, hearing both ears or loss of speech) $10,000 $10,000

PREMIUMS (ONE-TIME ANNUAL PAYMENT) 2022-23 Standard Plan 2021-22 Deluxe Plan

School Time Student Accident Coverage $46 $105

24 Hour-A-Day Accident Coverage $125 $275

Optional Football Only Accident Coverage $162 $369

All maximum amounts are per Injury except as specifically stated.
Injury means bodily injury, independent of disease or bodily infirmity, which directly results in loss covered by the Policy. The Injury must occur and the 
loss must begin while the coverage for the insured is in force under the Policy. 



 

 

 
 

ITEM: 2022-33 
DATE: March 17, 2022 
FILE:  Capital Projects Program 

 
 
Subject:     Asbestos Abatement Bids 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 

At the January 20, 2022 Board of Education meeting, the school board approved bids to address the roofs 
at Rolling Meadows High School (RMHS) and Forest View Educational Center (FVEC) and the final 
phase of the curtain wall replacement at Prospect High School (PHS) during the summer of 2022.  To 
complete the roof and curtain wall project, asbestos abatement is required at both locations at the roof 
drains and the exterior window panels at Prospect High School (PHS).  

In addition, the Bid includes abatement work in the English Department, the Art Room, and the Orchestra 
Room at John Hersey High School (JHHS) and additional abatement work at the Forest View Educational 
Center (FVEC). 

 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATIONS: 
 
Bids were received after a newspaper advertisement.  Additionally, bids were sent to nine vendors. Funds 
are budgeted in the Operations and Maintenance Fund. 
 
FVEC Abatement 
 Vendor                                               Base Bid 1A        Base Bid 1B         Base Bid 1C 
Husar Abatement, Ltd. (Franklin Park, IL) $190,400 $227,965 $23,240 
M&O Environmental Co. (Homewood, IL) $162,000 $170,000 $32,000 
Midway Contracting Group, LLC (Tinley Park, IL) $187,775 $210,100 $24,870 
Nationwide Envi. & Demo, LLC (Des Plaines, IL) $327,488 $378,688 $40,806 
Valor Technologies, Inc. (Bolingbrook, IL) $157,600 $159,000 $23,900 
 
 
 Vendor                                               Base Bid 1D        Base Bid 1E         Base Bid 1F 
Husar Abatement, Ltd. (Franklin Park, IL) $4,435 $127,300 $127,300 
M&O Environmental Co. (Homewood, IL) $15,000 $115,000 $134,000 
Midway Contracting Group, LLC (Tinley Park, IL) $9,630 $116,500 $137,500 
Nationwide Envi. & Demo, LLC (Des Plaines, IL) $17,600 $242,200 $240,000 
Valor Technologies, Inc. (Bolingbrook, IL) $10,500 $124,500 $120,000 
 
 



 

 

 Vendor                                               Base Bid 1G        Base Bid 1H         Base Bid 1I 
Husar Abatement, Ltd. (Franklin Park, IL) $6,160 $13,000 $7,200 
M&O Environmental Co. (Homewood, IL) $19,000 $20,000 $15,000 
Midway Contracting Group, LLC (Tinley Park, IL) $11,000 $10,250 $13,500 
Nationwide Envi. & Demo, LLC (Des Plaines, IL) $15,224 $38,400 $35,200 
Valor Technologies, Inc. (Bolingbrook, IL) $9,700 $23,000 $13,500 
 
The total of recommended Base Bid 1A, 1B, 1C, 1E, 1F,1H, and 1I for FVEC work is $621,500.  
The Base Bid 1D and 1G will not be awarded.   
 
 
JHHS Abatement 
 Vendor                                                   Base Bid           Alternate 1          Alternate 2 
Husar Abatement, Ltd. (Franklin Park, IL) $209,000 $18,000 $5,500 
M&O Environmental Co. (Homewood, IL) $147,000 $52,000 $10,000 
Midway Contracting Group, LLC (Tinley Park, IL) $152,400 $34,500 $8,000 
Nationwide Envi. & Demo, LLC (Des Plaines, IL) $229,400 $39,229 $17,000 
Valor Technologies, Inc. (Bolingbrook, IL) $137,000 $35,100 $5,800 
 
The total of recommended Base Bid, Alternate 1, and Alternate 2 for JHHS work is $177,900.   
 
 
PHS Abatement 
 Vendor  Base Bid 
Husar Abatement, Ltd. (Franklin Park, IL)  $33,000 
M&O Environmental Co. (Homewood, IL)  $25,000 
Midway Contracting Group, LLC (Tinley Park, IL)  $40,100 
Nationwide Environmental & Demo, LLC (Des Plaines, IL) $48,600 
Valor Technologies, Inc. (Bolingbrook, IL)  $112,500 
 
The total of recommended Base Bid for PHS work is $25,000.   
 
 
RMHS Abatement 
 Vendor  Base Bid 
Husar Abatement, Ltd. (Franklin Park, IL)  $18,000 
M&O Environmental Co. (Homewood, IL)  $14,000 
Nationwide Environmental & Demo, LLC (Des Plaines, IL) $11,500 
Valor Technologies, Inc. (Bolingbrook, IL)  $15,000 
 
The total of recommended Base Bid for RMHS work is $11,500.   
 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 



 

 

The Board of Education accept the bid from Valor Technologies, Inc., Bolingbrook, IL in the amount of 
$799,400 for asbestos abatement at FVEC and JHHS.  
 
The Board of Education accept the bid from M&O Environmental Co., Homewood, IL in the amount of 
$25,000 for asbestos abatement at PHS.  
 
The Board of Education accept the bid from Nationwide Environmental & Demo, LLC, Des Plaines, IL in 
the amount of $11,500 for asbestos abatement at RMHS.  
 
The Board hereby authorizes its Superintendent or designee to approve and execute contracts on behalf of 
the Board for services related to the project and approve and execute change orders. 
 
With respect to change orders that necessitate an increase in the cost of contracts by 10% or more, or 
which will change the time of completion by a total of 30 days or more, the Board hereby authorizes its 
Superintendent or designee to make the written determinations required by 720 ILCS 5/33E-9, that: (1) 
the circumstances said to necessitate the change in performance were not reasonably foreseeable at the 
time the contract was signed, or (2) the change is germane to the original contract as signed, or (3) the 
change order is in the best interest of the District and is authorized by law. 



  

 

 

ITEM:  2022-034 
DATE: March 17, 2022 
FILE:  Budget 

 
 
Subject:  Graduation Audio Services & Equipment Rental - RFP 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
 
Graduation ceremonies for Township High School District 214 are scheduled for May 18, 2022. Buffalo 
Grove, Elk Grove, John Hersey, Rolling Meadows, and Wheeling High Schools are planning to hold their 
ceremonies outdoors, requiring audio services and equipment rentals for seating and staging from a 
qualified vendor. Proposals were solicited for graduation audio services and equipment rentals, including 
the design, set-up, operation, and teardown of equipment in each school’s football stadium.  
 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATIONS: 
 
Proposals were received after newspaper advertisement. Additionally, proposal documents were sent to 
eight (8) vendors. 
  
  
Vendor Audio Total  Equipment Rental 
  BGHS EGHS WHS  
Concert Sound Systems, LLC (Chicago, IL) $15,000 $13,220 $2,197 $3,200  
Event Equipment Rentals & Sales (Hodgkins, IL) No Bid $10,179 $2,200 $3,500 
Audio Visual Productions (Bridgeview, IL)  $18,990 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
HRP Chicago, LLC (Mt. Prospect, IL)   $20,970 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
Axis AV, LLC (Skokie, IL)  $25,610 No Bid No Bid No Bid 
 
The lowest bidders meeting specifications are being recommended. 
 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
 
That the Board of Education accept the proposal from Concert Sound Systems, LLC in the amount of 
$20,397 to provide audio services for all graduations ceremonies and equipment rental for Elk Grove High 
School and Wheeling High School. Event Equipment Rentals & Sales for $10,179 to provide equipment 
rental for Buffalo Grove High School.  



  
ITEM: 2022-35 
DATE: March 17, 2022 
FILE:  Capital Projects Program 

  

 

 
 
Subject:     FVEC Training Facility Foundation and Shell Bid 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
 
At the January 20, 2022 Board of Education meeting the Operations Department Capital Projects Plan 
was outlined for work to be completed during the 2022-23 school year.  In the plan, the educational 
classrooms and the administrative areas at Forest View Educational Center (FVEC) are being renovated 
during the summer of 2022.  One of the areas is the new training facility addition, the bid includes the  
“shell” portion of the project (the structural parts, foundation, structure, and the roof).  
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATIONS: 
 
Bids were received after a newspaper advertisement.  Additionally, bids were sent to seven vendors. Funds 
are budgeted in the Operations and Maintenance Fund. 
 
 Vendor Base Bid Alternate #1         Alternate #1 
Boller Construction Co. Inc. (Waukegan, IL) $1,734,000 $266,000 $272,000 
Efraim Carlson & Son Inc. (Libertyville, IL) $1,767,700 $232,850 $294,700 
Stuckey Construction Co. (Waukegan, IL) $1,597,000 $222,000 $241,000 
 
The total of recommended Base Bid, Alternate 1, and Alternate 2 is $2,060,000.   
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
The Board of Education accept the bid from (Stuckey Construction Co., Waukegan, IL) in the amount of 
$2,060,000 for Training Facility Foundation and Shell work.  
 
The Board hereby authorizes its Superintendent or designee to approve and execute contracts on behalf of 
the Board for services related to the project and to approve and execute change orders. 
 
With respect to change orders that necessitate an increase in the cost of contracts by 10% or more, or 
which will change the time of completion by a total of 30 days or more, the Board hereby authorizes its 
Superintendent or designee to make the written determinations required by 720 ILCS 5/33E-9, that: (1) 
the circumstances said to necessitate the change in performance were not reasonably foreseeable at the 
time the contract was signed, or (2) the change is germane to the original contract as signed, or (3) the 
change order is in the best interest of the District and is authorized by law. 



ITEM: 2022-036
DATE: March 17, 2022
FILE: Curriculum

Subject:  2022-2023 Academic Programs and Pathways Guidebook Revisions and Curriculum
Changes--Part Two

BACKGROUND INFORMATION

The Board of Education is required by law to approve the district curriculum that is published in the
District 214 Academic Programs and Pathways Guidebook.  The guidebook is a compilation of important
academic information including the complete listing of the courses of study approved by the Board of
Education.  Prior to beginning the course selection process each school year, recommendations for
revisions to academic policies and procedures and/or the courses of study are prepared for the
consideration of the Board.

ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATION

In addition to the curriculum and academic policy changes that are approved by the Board of Education,
there are proposals for curriculum changes that result from the curriculum review by division heads,
associate principals for instruction, and building leadership teams.  The District Executive Council
approved the proposed changes.  The proposed curriculum changes include course number and title
changes, changes in course description, prerequisite and grade level changes, and minor edits in language
mechanics.

All curriculum changes approved by the Board of Education will be included in the 2022-2023 Academic
Programs and Pathways Guidebook.

RECOMMENDATION ACTION

That the Board of Education approve the 2022-2023 Academic Programs and Pathways Guidebook
Revisions and Curriculum Changes.

attachment



1 
 

2022-23 Academic Programs and Pathways Guidebook Changes--Part Two 
To BOE February 2022 
 
07361/07362 Name Change From: Spanish for Native Speakers 2 
  Name Change To: Spanish for Heritage Learners 2 
Grade Level: 9-12 
Grade/Sem: 0.50 
Course Level: Regular 
Prerequisite: Teacher Recommendation 
GR: Total credits, CTE/World Lang 
 
Students will be introduced to the formal study of Spanish and Latin American literary texts, from medieval times through 
the present. The course content reflects the equivalent of a third-year college course. Students will learn the biographical, 
historical, and cultural information related to each particular reading in order to fully conceptualize the work. Text analysis, 
thematic analysis, poetry analysis, literary terminology, and essay development will also be covered in great depth. Students 
will also further their knowledge of the Spanish language and Hispanic cultures and increase oral proficiency. This course 
will prepare students to take the College Board Advanced Placement Exam as well as college entrance examinations. 
 
 
11061/11062  Introduction to Rhetoric  
Grade Level: 12 
Grade/Sem: 0.50 
Course Level: Regular 
Prerequisite: Division Head Approval 
GR: Total credits, English 
 
Students will read, analyze, discuss and critically respond to non-fiction texts that may be organized around themes, critical 
issues or concepts that direct students’ focus to larger ideas in this writing intensive course. Students will write in a variety of 
modes, both formal and informal, for a variety of audiences, developing a sense of personal style and an ability to analyze the 
arguments and style of a given text, and articulate their response to that text in an engaging and academic style.  
 
 
59940  Consumer Education 
Grade Level: 9-12 
Grade/Sem: 0.25 
Course Level: Regular 
Prerequisite: None 
From: GR: Total credits, Social Science 
To: GR: Total credits, Miscellaneous 
 
Students will learn financial literacy, including installment purchasing, budgeting, savings and investing, banking, 
understanding simple contracts, State and federal income taxes, and personal insurance policies. This course meets the 
consumer education graduation requirement. 
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11071/11072 PLTW Engineering Essentials 
Grade Level: 9-12 
Grade/Sem: 0.5 
Course Level: Advanced Placement 
Prerequisite: None 
 
Students will explore the breadth of engineering career opportunities and experiences as they solve engaging and challenging 
real-world problems using powerful computer hardware and design software (Autodesk Inventor) to develop 3-D models or 
solid renderings. Students will build an engineering mindset and proficiency in key STEM-related career competencies 
including technical communication, collaboration, computational thinking, systems thinking, project management, and 
ethical reasoning. 



 
 

ITEM:  2022-037 
DATE: March  17, 2022 
FILE:  Budget 

 
 
Subject:  2022-23 Preliminary Budget Guidelines and Assumptions 
 
 
BACKGROUND INFORMATION: 
 
Budgets are estimates of projected revenues and projected expenditures for a specified period of time. For school 
districts this is a one-year period (fiscal year), which runs from July 1 through June 30. 
 
In December 2021, the Board of Education approved its 2021 property tax levy. Projected operating and working 
cash fund revenues for the 2022-23 budget are currently estimated at $278 million. Projected operating and 
working cash fund expenditures for the 2022-23 budget are currently estimated at $278 million. The district will 
continue cost containment initiatives as the 2022-23 budget is prepared. These projections are preliminary and 
may be adjusted as data becomes available. 
 
With ongoing uncertainty in the Illinois State Budget and federal funding, along with the many factors associated 
including the global COVID-19 pandemic, the global unrest, supply disruptions and inflation, the District 214 
budget may face necessary adjustments and/or reductions during preparation. As financial data is updated, we will 
adjust the District 214 budget accordingly. 
 
ADMINISTRATIVE CONSIDERATIONS: 
 
The Board of Education authorizes the development of the district's budget for the 2022-23 fiscal year. Based on 
changes in economic conditions at the local, state, and federal level, these estimates are subject to change since 
many factors that impact the new budget are unknown during the early stages of its development. 
 
Listed below are the guidelines, assumptions, and parameters that will be used in developing the 2022-23 budget: 
 
REVENUE 
 
• The Equalized Assessed Valuation (EAV) for 2020 was $10.2 billion. The EAV for 2019 was $10.0 billion. The 

EAV for 2018 was $8.6 billion. The EAV for 2017 was $8.6 billion. 
 

• Next year's overall tax receipts are based on the Consumer Price Index (CPI), the estimated new growth to the 
tax base, the impact of tax caps, and refunds. 
 

• The Consumer Price Index (CPI) reported as of December 31, 2021 is 7.0%  
 

• During 2022-23, it is anticipated that interest rates on investments continue to remain low. District 214 continues 
to receive less interest income based on deferred and delayed state and local revenues. 

 

• Property taxes are the district’s largest source of revenue for 2022-23. 
 

• Administration will continue to explore and review revenue options. 
  
 
 
 



 

ITEM:  2022  
DATE: March 17, 2022 
FILE:  Budget 
  
  

 
ENROLLMENT 
 
• The two-year cohort survival enrollment projections will be used in calculations for enrollment-related budget 

allocations. The enrollment report projects a slight enrollment decrease for 2022-23. 
 
SALARIES 
 
• Education Association (EA) employee base salaries will increase based on the current agreement. 

 

• Custodial Maintenance Association (CMA) employee base salaries will increase based on the current agreement. 
 

• The Educational Support Personnel (ESP) employees will increase based on the current agreement. 
 

• The Food Service employee base salaries generally increase by CPI. 
 

• Administrator and supervisor-employee salaries will increase based on the current agreement. 
 
STAFFING 
 
Education Association (EA) Staffing 
 
• The staffing calendar identifies the dates that staffing decisions are scheduled. As specific staffing decisions are 

made, adjustments will be incorporated into the budget. 
 

• For the purposes of the development of the preliminary 2022-23 budget, staffing will be determined based on 
estimated student enrollment, program needs, and funding sources. 
 

• Preliminary staffing recommendations will be determined during the staffing process. Recommendations on 
staffing adjustments will be made at that time. 
 

• Review and plan for reallocation, attrition, and efficiency of operations based on program needs and funding 
sources. At this time, 37 EA staff will retire at the end of the 2022-23 school year. 

 
Custodial Maintenance Association (CMA) Staffing 
 
• Review and plan for reallocation, attrition, and efficiency of operations based on program needs and funding 

sources. At this time, 1 CMA staff will retire at the end of the 2022-23 school year. 
 
Educational Support Personnel (ESP) Staffing 
 
• Review and plan for reallocation, attrition, and efficiency of operations based on program needs and funding 

sources. At this time, 8 ESP staff will retire at the end of the 2022-23 school year. 
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DATE: March 17, 2022 
FILE:  Budget 
  
  

 
 
Administrators/Supervisors 
 
• Review and plan for reallocation, attrition, and efficiency of operations based on program needs and funding 

sources. At this time, 5 Administrators and 9 Supervisors will retire at the end of the 2022-23 school year. 
 
BENEFITS / INSURANCE 
 
• Health insurance costs are projected at a 3% increase. However, insurance rules and regulations may be enacted 

which may cause potential changes to occur. Unemployment claims have increased, slightly. 
 

BUDGET ADJUSTMENTS 
 
• Inflation and supply disruptions are impacting costs of some supplies and services. We will continue to review 

and contain costs working with market trends and availability We will continue to monitor conditions for items 
such as utilities, gas, and postage. 
 

• There is a need to continue cost containment initiatives as the 2022-23 budget is prepared. 
 
TUITION INCENTIVE PROGRAM (TIP) 
 
• In 2022-23, per the Education Association contract, professional development will be funded based on the 

current agreement. 
 
SPECIAL EDUCATION 
 
• 2022-23 NSSEO tuition costs and programs are being reviewed by NSSEO. Final NSSEO program costs will 

reflect necessary changes. 
 
CAPITAL PROJECTS PROGRAM (CPP) 
 
• Approved capital projects will be included in the budget. 
 
TECHNOLOGY 
 
• Technology Services is anticipating continued replacement and updates of equipment and applications during 

2022-23.  
 
TRANSPORTATION 
 
• Transportation costs are anticipated to be higher based on contracts, staffing shortages, fuel costs, and usage. 
 
 

• We will continue to review options for student transportation cost containment. 
 
TRANSFERS, LOANS, AND ACCOUNTING RECOMMENDATIONS 
 

• Transfer from Operations and Maintenance to Capital Project Fund for funding of future Capital Projects. 
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FILE:  Budget 
  
  

 
• Due to delayed and deferred property tax revenue and state and federal revenue, inter-fund loans may be 

recommended to address cash flow needs. 
 

• Transfer working cash interest income to other funds may be recommended to address cash flow needs. 
 
RECOMMENDED ACTION: 
  
That the Board of Education discuss the proposed guidelines and assumptions relative to the preparation of the 
2022-23 fiscal year budget. 
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